

EXHIBIT A

Knapp v. Art.com, Inc.

Case No. 3:16-cv-00768-WHO

Timesheet: Aubry Wand

Date	Hours	Activity Description
10/12/15	2.50	Call with client; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; research on corp background of Def
10/13/15	.30	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/14/15	.30	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/15/15	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/16/15	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/17/15	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/18/15	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/19/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/20/15	5.40	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; legal research on false sale cases
10/21/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/22/15	.30	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; call with client
10/23/15	5.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; prep for/travel to meeting with client
10/24/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/25/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/26/15	3.40	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; legal research on false sale cases
10/27/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/28/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/29/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
10/30/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/1/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/2/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/3/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/4/15	.50	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; call with client
11/5/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/6/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/7/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/8/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/9/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/10/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/11/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/12/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/13/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/14/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/15/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/16/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots

11/17/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/18/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/19/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/20/15	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/21/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/22/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/23/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/24/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/25/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/26/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/27/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/28/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/29/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
11/30/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/1/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/2/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/3/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/4/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/5/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/6/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/7/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/8/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/9/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/10/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/11/15	.50	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/13/15	8.60	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; begin drafting complaint/CLRA letter
12/14/15	1.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; continue drafting complaint
12/15/15	1.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; continue drafting complaint
12/16/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/17/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/18/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/19/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/20/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/21/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/22/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/23/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/24/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/25/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/26/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/26/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/27/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/28/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/29/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
12/30/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots

12/31/15	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/1/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/2/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/3/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/4/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/5/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/6/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/7/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/8/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/9/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/10/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/11/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/12/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/13/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/14/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/14/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/15/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/16/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/17/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/18/16	6.30	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; continue drafting complaint
1/19/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/20/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/21/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
1/24/16	1.40	Continue drafting complaint
1/29/16	4.80	Continue drafting complaint/CLRA letter
2/10/16	4.10	Legal research on false sale cases
2/11/16	0.40	Revise CLRA letter
2/12/16	2.50	Meeting with client
2/13/16	4.80	Continue drafting complaint
2/14/16	3.50	Continue drafting complaint
2/15/16	4.70	Continue drafting complaint
2/16/16	7.90	Finalize/file complaint; draft initial disclosures and certificate of interested parties; finalize/mail CLRA letter
2/17/16	5.60	Call with client; begin drafting discovery to propound
2/22/16	6.70	Continue drafting discovery to propound
2/23/16	3.40	Continue drafting discovery to propound
3/2/16	7.20	Doc review/prepare Pl's docs for production
3/3/16	3.10	Begin drafting FAC
3/23/16	1.40	Finalize FAC
3/25/16	2.60	Legal research; begin drafting Rule 26 report
3/28/16	2.00	Email string with opposing counsel; continue drafting Rule 26 report and initial disclosures
4/4/16	.30	Email string with opposing counsel

4/18/16	2.20	Client meeting; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/19/16	.10	Review reassignment order and Def corp disclosure statement
4/21/16	.90	Review CMC order; research on court LR and standing orders; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/23/16	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/24/16	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/25/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/26/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/27/16	1.00	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; call/email string with client; draft/file ADR form
4/28/16	2.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; legal research on e-discovery and ESI stip
4/29/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
4/30/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/2/16	1.30	Review Def's MTD
5/3/16	8.60	Begin drafting opposition to MTD
5/4/16	3.40	Legal research for opposition to MTD
5/5/16	3.80	Continue drafting opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/5/16	.20	Email string with opposing counsel
5/6/16	9.10	Continue drafting opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/7/16	7.20	Continue drafting opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/8/16	.90	Draft RJN re. MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/9/16	.90	Legal research for opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/10/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/11/16	6.50	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; continue drafting Rule 26 report and discovery to propound
5/12/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/13/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/14/16	5.80	Continue drafting opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/15/16	3.90	Continue drafting discovery to propound; continue drafting opposition to MTD; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/16/16	9.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; finalize opposition MTD; continue drafting discovery to propound; prep for meet and confer
5/17/16	4.10	Travel to/attend meeting with opposing counsel re. Rule 26 report; revise joint report

5/18/16	3.50	Review Def's discovery served on Pl/begin drafting responses; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/19/16	5.90	Continue drafting Pl's disc responses; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/20/16	2.60	Continue drafting Pl's disc responses; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/21/16	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/23/16	.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; review Def's reply re. MTD
5/25/16	.80	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; prep for/participate in ADR call
5/26/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/27/16	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/28/16	.30	Email string with client; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/29/16	.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
5/30/16	3.20	Continue drafting Pl's disc responses
6/1/16	3.80	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; finalize joint report; finalize initial disclosures
6/2/16	.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; call with expert
6/3/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/4/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/5/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/6/16	2.90	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; prep for MTD/CMC hearing
6/7/16	4.00	Travel to/from SF for hearing on MTD/CMC
6/8/16	3.20	Prep for/attend hearing on MTD/CMC
6/9/16	.50	Email string with opposing counsel; email string with client; inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/10/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/11/16	.10	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots
6/12/16	1.20	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; draft proposed case schedule
6/13/16	.40	Email string with opposing counsel; call with client
6/14/16	.50	Inspect Def's websites/take screenshots; email string with opposing counsel; email string with client
6/15/16	4.90	Review/prep docs to produce to Def; call with client; email string with opposing counsel; review order re. mtn to dismiss; review/revise ntc of intent not to file amended complaint
6/16/16	5.50	Continue drafting discovery responses/preparing docs to produce; email string with opposing counsel
6/16/16	2.70	Finalize disc responses/docs to produce; email string with opposing counsel; call with client; review court order re. schedule
6/17/16	6.50	Call with client; finalize/serve discovery responses

6/21/16	.40	Draft Rule 30(b)(6) dep ntc; email string with opposing counsel
6/22/16	.30	Email string with opposing counsel; email string with client
6/23/16	3.90	Legal research re upcoming dep
6/24/16	1.30	Legal research; prep for client dep
6/27/16	1.00	Legal research; email string with opposing counsel
6/28/16	.90	Continue prep for client dep
6/30/16	.50	Email string/call with client
7/4/16	4.10	Doc review
7/5/16	.60	Review Def's answer to complaint
7/9/16	.20	Email string with client
7/10/16	.10	Review dep ntc of plaintiff
7/11/16	1.20	Dep prep; email string with client
7/12/16	3.40	Dep prep; legal research for upcoming depositions
7/13/16	4.30	Meeting with client to prepare for dep
7/14/16	8.90	Prep for/defend client depo
7/15/16	.60	Legal research on settlements of false sale cases
7/20/16	3.60	Call with mediator's office; draft settlement communication to opposing counsel; legal research on false sale cases
7/25/16	.10	Email string with opposing counsel
7/29/16	4.10	Review Pl dep transcript; draft errata
7/30/16	.20	Call with client
8/3/16	2.60	Review meet and confer email re. discovery; review/revise draft protective order; review proposal re. Rule 30(b)(6) dep
8/5/16	.70	Begin drafting Rule 30(b)(6) dep outline
8/11/16	3.60	Continue drafting outline for Rule 30(b)(6) dep; doc review
8/12/16	3.00	Continue drafting Rule 30(b)(6) dep outline
8/15/16	.20	Check on upcoming dates; review court orders
8/19/16	.50	Call and email string with opposing counsel
8/22/17	4.50	Review Def's written discovery responses
8/24/16	6.80	Doc review
8/25/16	5.20	Continue doc review; draft meet and confer letter; draft CMC statement
8/26/16	5.90	Continue doc review
8/31/16	3.90	Legal research; begin drafting mediation and class cert brief
9/1/16	6.20	Legal research; continue drafting cert and mediation brief
9/2/16	6.80	Legal research; continue drafting cert brief and mediation brief; call with expert
9/3/16	4.90	Continue drafting class cert brief
9/4/16	5.20	Continue drafting class cert brief

9/6/16	5.30	Continue drafting class cert brief
9/7/16	4.80	Research on marketing/economic experts; call with expert
9/8/16	5.30	Continue drafting cert brief
9/9/16	.30	Email string with Compeau
9/11/16	.60	Draft supplemental initial disclosures
9/12/16	3.10	Legal research; continue drafting class cert brief; review Compeau retainer
9/13/16	7.90	Continue drafting cert brief; review court minute order
9/15/16	.60	Email string with expert
9/16/16	7.10	Continue drafting cert brief
9/17/16	4.50	Continue drafting mediation brief
9/19/16	3.10	Continue drafting mediation brief
9/22/16	.60	Legal research for cert brief
9/23/16	5.50	Review additional docs produced by Def; research and draft administrative mtn to file under seal
9/25/16	1.80	Draft Compeau declaration
9/26/16	1.80	Call with Compeau; legal research re FTC guidelines
9/27/16	.50	Legal research on class cert issues
9/28/16	.60	Draft Pl declaration iso cert brief
9/29/16	2.80	Doc review; email string with client; review Def's supplemental discovery responses
9/30/16	5.60	Draft stip to continue cert filing date; review additional docs; email string with opposing counsel
10/2/16	4.40	Continue reviewing docs produced by Def
10/3/16	1.30	Email string with expert; draft mediation letter
10/4/16	.30	Email string with expert; review order granting stip
10/6/16	4.00	Continue drafting class cert brief
10/7/16	6.90	Continue drafting cert brief
10/8/16	1.20	Continue drafting cert brief
10/9/16	2.90	Continue drafting cert brief
10/10/16	6.80	Continue drafting cert brief
10/11/16	1.10	Call with expert; review/revise expert report
10/12/16	3.90	Call with expert; finalize expert report
10/13/16	6.80	Continue drafting cert brief
10/14/16	10.20	Finalize and file cert brief
10/17/16	.20	Call with expert re. dep schedule
10/18/16	.40	Email string with Compeau; call with client
10/19/16	.10	Email string with opposing counsel
10/20/16	.10	Email string with opposing counsel

10/24/16	1.00	Review Bergmark declaration; draft questions for dep prep
10/27/16	2.00	Continue drafting mediation brief
10/28/16	1.60	Continue drafting mediation brief; legal research on corp background
10/31/16	2.90	Continue drafting mediation brief; call with settlement admin
11/1/16	.60	Review/revise mediation brief
11/2/16	1.20	Call with opposing counsel; revise mediation brief
11/3/16	.20	Call with mediator's office; email string with opposing counsel
11/4/16	1.30	Review MSJ filed by Def
11/5/16	.10	Email string with opposing counsel
11/6/16	2.10	Prep for mediation; doc review; draft MOU for mediation
11/8/16	.80	Email string/review mediation info provided by opposing counsel
11/9/17	4.20	Travel to/from SF for mediation
11/10/16	9.40	Prep for/attend mediation
11/29/16	.10	Email string with opposing counsel re. settlement agreement
12/6/16	1.00	Draft stip to take hearings off calendar; email string with opposing counsel
12/9/16	.30	Email string with opposing counsel; finalize stip re. mtn for prelim approval
12/16/16	.20	Email string with opposing counsel re. settlement agreement
12/16/16	1.50	Review settlement agreement; email string with opposing counsel
12/17/16	1.80	Review/revise settlement agreement
12/18/16	3.10	Legal research; continue revising settlement agreement
12/19/16	2.40	Continue revising settlement agreement
12/22/16	6.90	Call with opposing counsel; revise attachments to settlement agreement; begin drafting mtn for prelim approval
12/23/16	2.50	Continue drafting mtn for prelim approval
12/24/16	3.40	Continue drafting mtn for prelim approval
1/10/17	3.90	Continue drafting mtn for prelim approval
1/12/17	.50	Prep for and call with opposing counsel
1/17/17	3.90	Continue drafting mtn for prelim approval/further revising settlement agreement
1/18/17	1.80	Prep for/meeting with client re. settlement agreement
1/19/17	1.20	Email string with opposing counsel re. settlement; continue drafting mtn for prelim approval
2/1/17	1.80	Further review/revise settlement agreement and exhibits
2/2/17	1.20	Review settlement agreement; email string with opposing counsel
2/5/17	.50	Call with opposing counsel re. settlement agreement
2/6/17	1.00	Call with settlement administrator; call/email string with client
2/7/17	7.20	Call/email string with opposing counsel; email string with client; continue drafting prelim approval mtn and revising settlement agreement

2/8/17	1.80	Continue drafting prelim approval mtn; email string with opposing counsel
2/10/17	.50	Email string with settlement administrator
2/13/17	4.10	Email string with opposing counsel; email string with client; finalize mtn for prelim approval
2/19/17	.10	Email string with client
2/21/17	.40	Email string with client; email string with opposing counsel
2/28/17	.20	Call with settlement administrator; email string with opposing counsel
3/8/17	4.70	Begin drafting mtn for final approval; email string with opposing counsel re. CAFA Notice
3/9/17	2.30	Continue drafting mtn for final approval; email string with opposing counsel
3/14/17	.10	Email string with opposing counsel re. prelim approval hearing
3/15/17	.20	Review stip to continue prelim hearing date
3/23/17	1.80	Continue drafting mtn for final approval
4/17/17	3.10	Prep for/call with opposing counsel; legal research amendment to class def
4/19/17	.20	Call with client re. prelim approval hearing
4/20/17	4.80	Legal research; continue drafting mtn for final approval
4/21/17	3.50	Continue drafting mtn for final approval
4/24/17	2.10	Continue drafting mtn for final approval
4/25/17	5.90	Review settlement agreement; email string with opposing; continue drafting mtn for final approval
4/26/17	.30	Email string with opposing counsel
4/27/17	.20	Email string with opposing counsel
4/28/17	2.90	Continue drafting mtn for final approval
5/1/17	5.50	Call/email string with opposing counsel; legal research; draft stip re. new dates and amended class definition; call with settlement admin
5/8/17	.90	Call with opposing counsel; review class notice; email string with settlement administrator
5/10/17	3.90	Email string with settlement administrator; legal research; review/revise stip to modify prelim approval order; call with settlement admin
5/12/17	.30	Review stip to amend class definition
5/15/17	.30	Email string/call with settlement administrator
5/20/17	.90	Review revised prelim approval order and settlement website; email string with settlement administrator
5/22/17	.20	Email string with settlement administrator
5/24/17	1.10	Final review of class notice and settlement website; call/email string with settlement administrator
5/26/17	.50	Research on class member question; review class notice status report
5/30/17	.20	Review objections to settlement
6/2/17	.40	Review class notice status report; call with settlement administrator

6/5/17	.10	Review objection to settlement
6/7/17	4.60	Continue drafting motion for final approval
6/8/17	.10	Review objection to settlement
6/9/17	.10	Review class notice status report
6/12/17	.10	Review objection to settlement
6/13/17	.10	Review objection to settlement
6/23/17	.10	Review class notice status report
6/25/17	2.80	Continue drafting motion for final approval
TOTAL	588.40	