

Knapp, James v. Art.com

## Billing Detail

Date	Time Keeper	Rate	Hours	Charge	Description
2/16/2016	JHK	\$775	25	19,375	work prior to filing of complaint from 1/1/16
2/16/2016	TMS	\$835	10	\$8,350	work prior to filing of complaint from 1/1/16
2/17/2016	EC	\$250	0.1	\$25	updating CM.
2/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to A. Wand and J. Hwang re contact information for client
2/17/2016	CKK	\$550	0.7	\$385	Calendaring initial CMC and ADR deadlines.
2/19/2016	CJW	\$250	0.3	\$75	Create Postage code. Confirm copy code is created. Document split of common costs in CM and Sharepoint
2/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re consent to magistrate judge
2/25/2016	TMS	\$835	0.1	\$84	Work re consent to Mag Judge
2/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to K. Bates re filing consent to magistrate judge jurisdiction
2/26/2016	STM	\$300	0.4	\$120	File Consent to Magistrate Judge Jurisdiction
3/2/2016	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	review local rules and judge's standing orders and assemble same and related materials for service on defendant
3/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email and call with A. Wand re update on status
3/9/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re waiver of service and email to A. Wand re same
3/10/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re filing of waiver of summons
3/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review and comment on amended complaint and email to A. Wand re filing and service of
3/16/2016	TMS	\$835	0.4	\$334	Work re amended complaint
3/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re Rule 26 meeting
3/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	review and comment on amended complaint, file same, email to opposing counsel re same, and emails to co-counsel re same
3/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re service of amended complaint and review email from A. Kuljis re same
3/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to K. Bates re courtesy copy of amended complaint to chambers
3/25/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re certificate of interested parties
4/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to A. Wand re status of discovery scheduling

Exhibit 1

4/4/2016	TMS	\$835	0.4	\$334	Review of status of discovery scheduling
4/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re scheduling Rule 26 meeting
4/25/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review CMC order and emails to A. Wand and K. Bates re same
4/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review CMC order and email to A. Kuljis re service of same
4/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	review requirements re ADR certification, emails to co-counsel and opposing counsel re same, call with opposing counsel re same, and complete forms re same
5/3/2016	EPG	\$300	1	\$300	update pleading templates
5/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review motion to dismiss and email with A. Wand re preparing opposition re same
5/3/2016	TMS	\$835	2.7	\$2,255	r/a oppo to MTD
5/4/2016	KGB	\$675	0.3	\$203	Corr w/staff re service of CMC order
5/4/2016	SLG	\$400	0.4	\$160	File COS for CMC Order via ND Cal ECF; search for correct filing event
5/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with staff re filing COS re CMC order
5/7/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and comment on draft opposition to motion to dismiss
5/9/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with opposing counsel re moving scheduling conference and email to A. Wand re same
5/15/2016	JXK	\$775	2.5	\$1,938	review and revise opposition to motion to dismiss and email to co-counsel re same
5/16/2016	KGB	\$675	0.5	\$338	Review of documents for filing, comm w/STM re same
5/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	email and call with A. Wand re preparation for Rule 26 meeting
5/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with A. Wand re filing of opposition to motion to dismiss, review final draft of same, and emails to K. Bates re filing and serving same
5/16/2016	STM	\$300	3	\$900	Prepare and file Opposition to Motion to Dismiss; send Word version to judge, arrange for courtesy copy delivery
5/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	attend conference call with co-counsel for Rule 26 meeting
5/17/2016	TMS	\$835	0.5	\$418	Debrief w/JHK re R26 mtg
5/17/2016	STM	\$300	3	\$900	Coordinate courtesy copy deliveries for Opp to MTD
5/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review discovery requests from defendant and review and reply to email from A. Wand re same
5/19/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and revise joint report and ESI protocol and email to opposing counsel re same
5/19/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails to co-counsel re attendance at scheduling conference and hearing and review replies to same
5/20/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from M. Keshavari re rescheduling scheduling conference
5/22/2016	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	meeting with A. Wand re discovery and hearing on motion to dismiss
5/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re stipulation to move case management conference
5/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with A. Wand re ADR conference call

5/25/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with court alternative dispute resolution coordinator re ADR options and timing of same
5/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re discovery to Art.com
5/31/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review revisions to joint case management statement and emails to A. Wand and opposing counsel re same
5/31/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and comment on draft responses to discovery requests to plaintiff
5/31/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	revise, finalize, and serve initial disclosures
5/31/2016	JXK	\$775	1.4	\$1,085	research re potential experts and contact same re initial meeting
6/1/2016	EPG	\$300	0.7	\$210	create service list for the case. Correct templates to show correct venue, case No.
6/1/2016	EPG	\$300	1	\$300	edit cmc stmt to correct typos, file via ECF. Mult. comm w/ KGB, PRR, JGH re filing, service and courtesy copies
6/1/2016	EPG	\$300	0.96	\$288	upload filed CMC stmt to One Legal platform for delivery of courtesy copy to judge Orrick.
6/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to A. Wand and staff re filing joint case management statement
6/2/2016	TMS	\$835	0.6	\$501	Review of CM Statement
6/2/2016	JXK	\$775	0.8	\$620	prepare for and attend call with B. Bergmark and follow up emails re same
6/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	call with A. Wand re discovery and expert retention
6/6/2016	JXK	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	call with B. Bergmark re discovery requests, revise same, and email to co-counsel re same
6/7/2016	TMS	\$835	4.2	\$3,507	Prep to argue on MTD and CMC
6/8/2016	KGB	\$675	3	\$2,025	Hearing on MTD, CMC before J Orrick and preparation re same
6/8/2016	TMS	\$835	3	\$2,505	travel to and attend CMC and argument on MTD
6/10/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from co-counsel re proposed schedule
6/11/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from co-counsel re proposed schedule
6/12/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re proposed schedule
6/13/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with A. Wand and K. Bates re proposed schedule and review and reply to follow-up emails re same
6/14/2016	EPG	\$300	0.6	\$180	efile Stipulation re CMC schedule and proposed order.
6/14/2016	EPG	\$300	0.3	\$90	email word version of PO to judge
6/14/2016	EPG	\$300	0.4	\$120	upload filed copies of stip and PO to One Legal to send courtesy copies to the judge
6/15/2016	KGB	\$675	1.2	\$810	Drafting Notice of Intent Not To File 2d Am Compl, corr w/coc, filing same
6/15/2016	SLG	\$400	0.5	\$200	File ntc of intent not to file SAC via ND Cal ECF; prep chambers copy; place order for chambers copy deliv w/ One Legal
6/15/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review order re motion to dismiss and to strike and emails to co-counsel re follow-up from same

6/16/2016	JXX	\$775	0.3	\$233	review documents for production and call with A. Wand re same
6/21/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and respond to emails from A. Wand and opposing counsel re discovery
6/23/2016	TMS	\$835	0.7	\$585	Review documents re potential settlement possibilities
6/23/2016	JXX	\$775	0.5	\$388	emails with co-counsel re settlement and prepare background information for same
6/27/2016	JXX	\$775	0.1	\$78	review emails from A. Wand re protective order and ESI protocol
6/28/2016	KGB	\$675	3.8	\$2,565	Drafting M&C letter to OC re class certification and damages models, research re same
6/28/2016	TMS	\$835	0.8	\$668	Review of M&C letter
6/28/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review draft correspondence re settlement and emails re same
7/5/2016	JXX	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to opposing counsel re protective order and ESI protocol
7/5/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review answer to complaint
7/6/2016	JXX	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re ESI protocol
7/7/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from opposing counsel re scheduling call and discovery extension and email to K. Bates re same
7/8/2016	KGB	\$675	0.5	\$338	Telecon w/OC re ESI, discovery, corr w/TMS re same
7/8/2016	JXX	\$775	1	\$775	call with opposing counsel re discovery and settlement and follow-up emails re same
7/9/2016	JXX	\$775	1	\$775	meeting with A. Wand re update on settlement and discovery
7/9/2016	JXX	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails to T. Schneider and A. Wand re settlement concepts
7/9/2016	TMS	\$835	0.4	\$334	Review of corr re settlement concepts
7/11/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails re discovery issues and plaintiff deposition
7/11/2016	JXX	\$775	0.7	\$543	draft preparation outline for plaintiff deposition
7/12/2016	JXX	\$775	0.8	\$620	call with A. Wand re deposition preparation for Knapp
7/12/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	review emails from A. Wand re settlement proposals
7/13/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to opposing counsel re 30b6 deposition and review reply to same
7/13/2016	JXX	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re Knapp deposition preparation
7/18/2016	JXX	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	draft 30b6 notice and email to co-counsel re same
7/19/2016	JXX	\$775	0.7	\$543	revise 30b6 notice, emails to co-counsel re same, and email to opposing counsel re same and other pending discovery issues
7/20/2016	JXX	\$775	0.4	\$310	call with T. Schneider re settlement and review emails from T. Schneider, M. Keshavari, and A. Wand re same
7/20/2016	TMS	\$835	0.5	\$418	Prep for and call w/JHK re settlement and emails re same
7/29/2016	JXX	\$775	0.3	\$233	review proposed errata to Knapp deposition transcript and email to A. Wand re same
8/1/2016	JXX	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to opposing counsel re pending discovery issues
8/2/2016	JXX	\$775	0.5	\$388	review proposed protective order, compare to models from court, and email to opposing counsel re same
8/2/2016	JXX	\$775	0.4	\$310	call with opposing counsel re 30b6 notice and other pending discovery issues

8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	review and reply to emails from opposing counsel re proposed protective order and prepare redline re same
8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	revise and finalize 30b6 notice, serve same, and review and reply to email from M. Keshavarzi re same
8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails with co-counsel re response to email from opposing counsel re document requests and interrogatories
8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from M. Keshavarzi re schedule for 30b6 deposition
8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	1.3	\$1,008	draft email re further specifications of 30b6 topics, email to co-counsel re same, revise same in response to comments, and transmit to opposing counsel
8/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	call with A. Wand re discovery strategy
8/5/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from M. Kesharvi re rescheduling discovery meet and confer
8/6/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and respond to email from A. Wand re pending discovery issues for discussion
8/8/2016	JXK	\$775	0.9	\$698	prepare for and attend meet and confer teleconference with opposing counsel
8/9/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	prepare for and attend meet and confer call with opposing counsel re answers to interrogatories
8/11/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to B. Bergmark re sampling of data and review email from A. Wand re same
8/12/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review 30b6 deposition outline from A. Wand and email to A. Wand re same
8/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review email from A. Wand re status of discovery
8/15/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	call to B. Bergmark re data sampling
8/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	call with B. Bergmark re data sampling and email to opposing counsel with proposal re same
8/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re status of protective order
8/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re data sampling and protective order
8/19/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and reply to emails re Art.com discovery responses
8/22/2016	EC	\$250	0.4	\$100	uploaded docs to server.
8/22/2016	JXK	\$775	5.5	\$4,263	review documents produced by Art.com and discovery responses for use at deposition and prepare for deposition; email and call with opposing counsel and co-counsel re same
8/23/2016	EC	\$250	0.2	\$50	downloading and uploading doc production
8/23/2016	JXK	\$775	5	\$3,875	travel from Los Angeles to San Francisco for 30b6 deposition of Art.com
8/23/2016	JXK	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	prepare for 30b6 deposition of Art.com and email to A. Wand re same
8/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to opposing counsel and court reporter re moving start time of deposition
8/24/2016	KGB	\$675	1	\$675	Gathering exhibitis for deposition
8/24/2016	EC	\$250	0.1	\$25	downloading and uploading supplemental doc to server.
8/24/2016	JXK	\$775	5	\$3,875	travel from San Francisco to Los Angeles from Art.com deposition
8/24/2016	JXK	\$775	4.5	\$3,488	travel to and take 30b6 deposition of Art.com

8/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	conference with K. Bates, A. Wand, and T. Schneider re follow-up from Art.com 30b6 deposition
8/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from A. Kuljis re scheduling call to discuss data sampling
8/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to email from A. Wand re status of discovery
8/29/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with A. Wand re discovery follow-up and emails re same
8/30/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	prepare for and attend call with opposing counsel re data sampling
9/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	revise case management conference statement
9/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	review notes and draft email to opposing counsel re follow-up requests from depositions and email to A. Wand re same
9/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	email to B. Bergmark re update and schedule and review reply re same
9/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review email from A. Wand re summary of research on class certification
9/2/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re class certification theories and potential experts
9/6/2016	EC	\$250	0.5	\$125	Serving Courtesy Copies re CMC
9/6/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with A. Wand re pending discovery and expert retention
9/6/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review proposed changes from opposing counsel to case management report, email to opposing counsel re same, and finalize and arrange for filing of same
9/7/2016	EC	\$250	0.2	\$50	checking on status of courtesy copy for CMC.
9/7/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re retention of Compeau
9/8/2016	EC	\$250	0.7	\$175	researching judges standing orders on courtcalls
9/8/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re outcome of call with opposing counsel
9/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.4	\$100	Attempting to set up CourtCall for CMC.
9/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.7	\$175	checking local rules for cmc courtcall info.
9/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.3	\$75	comms re CMC telephonic/courtcall set up.
9/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.2	\$50	comms with clerk of court to set up telephonic appearance for KGB for CMC.
9/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.6	\$150	Comms re telephonic call in process. calling clerk and leaving VM to update call.
9/9/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails with staff and opposing counsel re arrangements for telephonic hearing
9/9/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re sales data
9/12/2016	EC	\$250	0.4	\$100	Calling clerk to fix telephonic appearances.
9/12/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to opposing counsel and K. Bates re arrangements for telephonic case management conference
9/12/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to email from A. Wand re discovery needed for class certification and timing of same
9/12/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review Campeau retention and email to J. Hwang re payment of same
9/13/2016	JGH	\$300	0.1	\$30	Write check for SW share of expert retainer to Larry D. Compeau,Ph.D.

9/13/2016	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	attend telephonic case management conference
9/13/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails to M. Lim and A. Wand re meeting to discuss class certification
9/14/2016	JXK	\$775	4	\$3,100	research and draft outline for class certification motion
9/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re form of answers to questions to questions about computer systems
9/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review order from case management conference
9/14/2016	MSL	\$250	0.5	\$125	Review complaint and prepare notes for 9/15 meeting with JHK
9/15/2016	JXK	\$775	4.5	\$3,488	meeting with A. Wand and M. Lim re planning for class certification motion, revise outline re same, and email to B. Bergmark re same
9/15/2016	MSL	\$250	3.1	\$775	Meeting with JXK and A.Wand re: class cert issues
9/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review letter from opposing counsel re computer systems
9/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review draft class certification brief
9/19/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review emails from A. Wand and T. Schneider re information requests for mediation
9/19/2016	JXK	\$775	3.7	\$2,868	research and review documents in preparation for call with B. Bergmark re class certification motion, call with B. Bergmark re same, and compile discovery documents for B. Bergmark and transmit same
9/20/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re information for mediation
9/20/2016	MSL	\$250	0.8	\$200	Legal research for class certification issues
9/21/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Kuljis re status of document production
9/22/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to B. Bergmark re promotion code tables
9/22/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with opposing counsel re document production and follow-up email re same
9/22/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and analyze tables of coupon codes
9/22/2016	MSL	\$250	3.1	\$775	Legal research and draft memo re: class cert issues
9/22/2016	MSL	\$250	1	\$250	Legal research and draft memo re: class cert issues
9/22/2016	MSL	\$250	1.9	\$475	prepare attachment to memo re: class cert issues
9/23/2016	EC	\$250	0.3	\$75	downloading docs and uploading to server
9/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from staff re organizing document production
9/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	emails with opposing counsel re production and call with M. Keshavarzi and A. Wand re same
9/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to B. Bergmark re transaction data
9/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review and analyze transactional data
9/23/2016	AXL	\$625	0.2	\$125	Downloaded new document production.
9/23/2016	AXL	\$625	0.3	\$188	Moved recent document production downlad to Scanned inbox and emailed Mail for processing.
9/23/2016	MSL	\$250	0.1	\$25	Sent email to JXK re: memo for class cert

9/23/2016	MSL	\$250	2	\$500	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review memorandum from M. Lim re class certification research and email to M. Lim re same
9/24/2016	MSL	\$250	1.4	\$350	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/25/2016	MSL	\$250	2.4	\$600	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/26/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	prepare for, travel to, and attend meeting with opposing counsel to review documents
9/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with A. Wand re class certification strategy
9/26/2016	MSL	\$250	4.8	\$1,200	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/26/2016	MSL	\$250	1.2	\$300	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review recent 9th circuit case re class certification and email to A. Wand re same
9/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review archived web pages for class certification motion and email to M. Lim re obtaining more
9/27/2016	MSL	\$250	1.1	\$275	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/27/2016	MSL	\$250	2.4	\$600	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/27/2016	MSL	\$250	4.2	\$1,050	Research old webpages and add to spreadsheet
9/27/2016	MSL	\$250	0.2	\$50	sent email re: progress of webpage research and questions
9/28/2016	JXK	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	review documents produced by defendant
9/28/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and comment on draft declaration for class certification and amended disclosures
9/29/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to A. Wand re stipulation to modify class certification briefing schedule
9/29/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	review documents and data produced by Art.com and emails to B. Bergmark re same
9/29/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	research for motion for class certification
9/29/2016	AXL	\$625	0.6	\$375	Downloading new document production and sent it for processing.
9/30/2016	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	emails and call with opposing counsel re stipulation to modify class certification deadlines and review and revise same
9/30/2016	JXK	\$775	1.1	\$853	prepare for and attend call with B. Bergmark re status of expert report and follow-up email re same
9/30/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with A. Wand re update on discussions with B. Bergmark and opposing counsel
9/30/2016	JXK	\$775	1.2	\$930	review website captures for use in class certification motion
9/30/2016	AXL	\$625	0.2	\$125	Downloading new document production and sent them to be processed.
9/30/2016	MSL	\$250	0.5	\$125	Search for samples of webpages for class cert motion.
10/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	revise, finalize, and file stipulation re class certification deadlines and proposed order
10/1/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from M. Lim re organizing web captures for class certification motion
10/1/2016	MSL	\$250	0.4	\$100	Search for better samples of webpages for class cert motion.



10/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	draft letter to opposing counsel requesting information for settlement
10/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review compilation of web capture pages and email to A. Wand re same
10/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to email from A. Wand re motion to seal for class certification and identify model for same
10/4/2016	SLG	\$400	0.3	\$120	Calendar new class cert briefing sched
10/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re class certification motion
10/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	process deadlines for mediation
10/4/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review corrections to Takemoto deposition
10/6/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re class certification motion
10/7/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	call and email to B. Bergmark re status of expert report
10/8/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re class certification brief
10/9/2016	EC	\$250	0.7	\$175	research on judges standing order and local rules re courtcall set up.
10/10/2016	JXK	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	review draft of class certification motion and meeting with A. Wand re same
10/10/2016	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	emails and call with B. Bergmark and L. Petite, review preliminary analysis, and email to A. Wand re same
10/11/2016	JXK	\$775	1.2	\$930	prepare for and attend call with B. Bergmark re expert report
10/11/2016	JXK	\$775	0.8	\$620	review and comment on draft report of Compeau and calls with A. Wand re same
10/11/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	email to M. Lim re research for class certification motion and review response to same
10/11/2016	MSL	\$250	0.7	\$175	Research class certification cases and prepare short summary.
10/13/2016	JXK	\$775	5	\$3,875	revise motion for class certification and emails to A. Wand re same
10/13/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	calls with B. Bergmark re revising report, emails to B. Bergmark re same, review and comment on same, and research for same
10/13/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from P. Ivie re estimate of administration costs for mediation
10/13/2016	STM	\$300	0.8	\$240	Check courtesy copy specifications for Class Cert Motion
10/14/2016	JXK	\$775	7.5	\$5,813	revise, finalize, and file motion for class certification and supporting documents including motion to seal
10/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	calls with A. Wand re motion for class certification filing and emails to staff re same
10/14/2016	JXK	\$775	10	\$7,750	call with B. Bergmak re expert report and review and comment on same
10/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	email to M. Lim re research for class certification motion and review reply re same
10/14/2016	MSL	\$250	0.5	\$125	Emails to and from (5 total) JXK re: class cert research
10/14/2016	MSL	\$250	1.3	\$325	legal research re: class cert
10/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email proposed orders to chambers
10/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to S. Marks re instructions for courtesy copies
10/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	calls and emails with opposing counsel and B. Bergmark re scheduling deposition
10/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from S. Marks re courtesy copies of class certification papers

10/17/2016	STM	\$300	8	\$2,400	Courtesy copies of Class Cert (redacted and unredacted versions), Admin. Mtn to File under Seal
10/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	emails to B. Bergmark and opposing counsel re deposition and subpoena; review subpoena and research re objections to same
10/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review proposal re class administration, email to co-counsel re same, and reply to same requesting revision
10/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re expert depositions
10/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from S. Marks re courtesy copy of class certification papers
10/19/2016	JXK	\$775	1.2	\$930	calls and emails with B. Bergmark and opposing counsel re deposition scheduling and production of documents and review documents for same
10/20/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re scheduling Comeau deposition
10/21/2016	LEC	\$250	0.2	\$50	scanning and sent letter to mail for process and mail it out
10/21/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to A. Wand re notice of ADR conference
10/21/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from B. Bergmark and staff re documents to produce
10/21/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from opposing counsel re meeting to discuss information for settlement
10/21/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review emails re status of mediator payment
10/22/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re ADR conference
10/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.8	\$620	review documents for response to Bergmark subpoena
10/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re preparation for Bergmark deposition
10/24/2016	JXK	\$775	1.5	\$1,163	travel to and attend meeting with M. Keshavarzi and A. Kuljis re settlement issues, call with co-counsel re response to same, and email to M. Keshavarzi re same
10/24/2016	JXK	\$775	1.3	\$1,008	draft objections to Bergmark subpoena and assemble documents for production re same
10/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from B. Bergmark re scheduling prep time
10/24/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	attend ADR telephone conference
10/24/2016	TMS	\$835	0.2	\$167	Conf call re settlement
10/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with B. Bergmark re deposition preparation
10/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to A. Wand re settlement
10/26/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	complete ADR stipulation and email to opposing counsel re same
10/27/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	prepare for and attend call with B. Bergmark re preparation for deposition and emails re scheduling same
10/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re co-counsel agreement
10/28/2016	JXK	\$775	6.5	\$5,038	travel to and defend deposition of B. Bergmark and meeting with B. Bergmark re same
10/29/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re information for settlement and injunctive relief

10/30/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re mediation brief
11/1/2016	JXK	\$775	2.6	\$2,015	revise mediation statement and emails to co-counsel re same
11/2/2016	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	call with co-counsel re mediation brief and review and comment on same
11/3/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to emails from opposing counsel re confidential information filed as part of motion for class certification
11/7/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to M. Keshavarzi re settlement information
11/9/2016	TMS	\$835	4.5	\$3,758	review case file and information about comparable settlements to prepare for mediation
11/10/2016	TMS	\$835	7.5	\$6,263	travel to, prepare for, and attend mediation
11/10/2016	JXK	\$775	4	\$3,100	travel from San Francisco to Los Angeles from mediation
11/10/2016	JXK	\$775	7	\$5,425	attend mediation
11/10/2016	CJW	\$250	0.6	\$150	Generate Copy/Postage Report and Cost in IM not in QB Report. Combine reports with Costs from QB to produce Final Costs Report. Email to JGH for review
11/11/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to A. Wand and T. Schneider re follow-up from settlement
11/14/2016	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	prepare draft joint motion for settlement and emails to opposing counsel re same
11/15/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and comment on draft notice of settlement
11/17/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails to A. Wand and opposing counsel re settlement documentation
11/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from J. Hwang and A. Wand re Bergmark invoice
11/18/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from B. Bergmark re invoice
11/23/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to opposing counsel re invoice for Bergmark deposition
12/6/2016	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with M. Keshavarzi re stipulation for pending motions and email to A. Wand and K. Bates re preparing same
12/8/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re stipulation re pending motions
12/9/2016	LEC	\$250	0.5	\$125	shadowing STM to file with ECF system
12/13/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from P. Ivie re settlement administration
12/16/2016	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from M. Keshavarzi re call to discuss settlement agreement draft
12/19/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from M. Keshavarzi re draft settlement agreement and scheduling call to discuss
12/21/2016	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	review and comment on draft settlement agreement and emails with A. Wand re same
12/22/2016	JXK	\$775	1.2	\$930	prepare for and attend conference call to discuss settlement agreement and follow-up emails re same
12/23/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	revise proposed settlement agreement and emails to M. Keshavarzi and A. Wand re same
12/27/2016	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to M. Keshavarzi re class certification motion
12/30/2016	JXK	\$775	2	\$1,550	research for motion for preliminary approval of settlement and class certification
1/3/2017	JXK	\$775	3	\$2,325	revise motion for preliminary approval and emails to opposing counsel re same

1/3/2017	CJW	\$250	0.8	\$200	Generate Copy/Postage report and Costs in IM not in QB report. Merge with Costs in QB to produce Final Costs report. Email Final Costs to JJXK
1/4/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	call with M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement filing
1/10/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to A. Wand and M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement agreement
1/12/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	emails with M. Keshavarzi and A. Wand re finalizing settlement filings and call re same
1/16/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review proposed revisions to settlement agreement
1/17/2017	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and comment on revised settlement agreement and emails with A. Wand and M. Keshavarzi re same
1/19/2017	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	review revisions to motion for preliminary approval, research re same, and emails to A. Wand re same
1/24/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call and emails with A. Wand and M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement
1/25/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement papers
1/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement papers and email to co-counsel re same
1/30/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re status of settlement papers
1/31/2017	JXK	\$775	1.9	\$1,473	review and revise settlement documents and emails to A. Wand re same
2/1/2017	JXK	\$775	1.6	\$1,240	revise settlement agreement, class notice, and final judgment and email to M. Keshavarzi re same; review Takemoto declaration and email to M. Keshavarzi re same
2/2/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and reply to emails from A. Wand re settlement filings
2/6/2017	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	call with A. Wand and M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement documents
2/7/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call and emails re claims administrator declaration
2/8/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with A. Wand re settlement documents
2/9/2017	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	revise motion for preliminary approval and emails to A. Wand and opposing counsel re same
2/10/2017	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	call with A. Wand and J. Prutsman re class administrator declaration and review and revise same
2/13/2017	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	review and comment on revised settlement papers
2/14/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from A. Wand re status of settlement papers
2/22/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to email from M. Keshavarzi re settlement filings
2/23/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with M. Keshavarrzi re settlement filing and email to A. Wand re follow-up to same
2/24/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement filing
2/27/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement documents
2/28/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement filing
3/1/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with M. Keshavarzi re status of settlement filing
3/2/2017	EC	\$250	0.6	\$150	preparing courtesy copies of Ps mtn for preliminary approval of sttlmnt and attachments.

3/2/2017	JXK	\$775	3	\$2,325	revise, finalize, and file motion for preliminary approval of settlement and supporting documents
3/8/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re CAFA notice
3/10/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and respond to emails re CAFA notice
3/13/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with M. Keshavarzi and A. Wand re rescheduling hearing on motion for preliminary approval of settlement
3/15/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	email to M. Keshavarzi re approval of stipulation to move hearing date and call with T. Schneider re same
4/17/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with opposing counsel re preparing for preliminary approval hearing and follow-up emails with co-counsel re same
4/18/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails with co-counsel re preliminary approval hearing and review email from M. Keshavarzi re same
4/19/2017	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	calls with T. Schneider and A. Wand re preliminary approval hearing and follow-up research from same
4/20/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	emails with A. Wand re follow-up from preliminary approval
4/24/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	research re form attorney fee motions and email to A. Wand re same
4/25/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review emails from M. Keshavarzi and A. Wand re parameters for class notice
4/27/2017	SLG	\$400	0.3	\$120	Review prelim apprvl order for calendaring purposes; email JHK re ambiguity w/ dates in order
4/27/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review outstanding invoices and email to A. Wand re same
5/1/2017	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	review and revise stipulation re class notice and call with A. Wand re same
5/1/2017	JXK	\$775	0.7	\$543	call with A. Wand, M. Keshavrzi, A. Kuljis, and J. Prestman re class notice
5/2/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to A. Wand re class certification stipulation
5/3/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	emails with staff and A. Wand re outstanding expert invoice
5/10/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	calls with T. Schneider and A. Wand re class definition amendment proposal and class notice
5/11/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with M. Keshavarzi re class certification stipulation and class notice
5/12/2017	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	review and revise stipulation and proposed order, emails with opposing counsel and co-counsel re same, and call with A. Wand re same
5/15/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	call with M. Keshavarzi and co-counsel re status of class notice and emails with co-counsel re same
5/15/2017	TMS	\$835	0.1	\$84	Conf call co-c re settlment and class list.
5/17/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	call with A. Kuljis re contacting court to check on stipulation and email to co-counsel re same
5/19/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review order re class deadlines and call with A. Wand re same

5/20/2017	JXK	\$775	0.4	\$310	emails with A. Wand re class notice and website revisions
5/22/2017	JXK	\$775	1	\$775	emails with A. Wand re class notice and website, review and comment on same, call with opposing counsel and class administrator re same, and research re same
5/24/2017	KGB	\$675	1	\$675	Return calls to class members re settlement, documenting same, corr w/JHK re same
5/24/2017	JXK	\$775	1.8	\$1,395	review, respond to, and process emails from class members and emails to class administrator and opposing counsel re same
5/24/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and approve class notice and website and emails with opposing counsel and class administrator re same
5/25/2017	LEC	\$250	0.2	\$50	communication with caller in re email received about settlement
5/25/2017	LEC	\$250	0.1	\$25	communication with KGB in re caller and email received about settlement
5/25/2017	EPG	\$300	0.3	\$90	mtg w/ LAR, MXJ re class member calls re settlement. comm w/ TMS re same. comm w/ team re same. create spreadsheet for tracking such calls.
5/25/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	discussion with Kyle regarding how to respond to some of the questions being asked by callers.
5/25/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	Incoming call from class member who wants to be excluded . Answered questions
5/25/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.1	\$60	Incoming call from class member with question.
5/25/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.1	\$60	Incoming call from class member
5/25/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.1	\$60	incoming call from class member
5/25/2017	JXK	\$775	2.2	\$1,705	review, reply to, and process emails from class members and calls with class members
5/25/2017	LAR	\$250	0.3	\$75	Research on case before taking incoming calls from settlement members
5/25/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Call with a member regarding settlement details
5/25/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Meeting with EPG regarding outreach and incoming calls
5/26/2017	LEC	\$250	0.1	\$25	communication with MXJ in re what info to provide for callers
5/26/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	incoming call from a class member with questions
5/26/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.3	\$180	Updated spreadsheet
5/26/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	incoming call asking questions
5/26/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.1	\$60	Incoming call from class member
5/26/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	Incoming call from a class member asking questiions
5/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.8	\$620	review, process, and respond to class member emails and update record of class member calls
5/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review and reply to emails from A. Wand and K. Bates re response to class member inquiries
5/26/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Providing an update to a class member regarding the settlement
5/29/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
5/30/2017	LEC	\$250	0.1	\$25	communication with MXJ in re callers excel sheet

5/30/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.4	\$240	Updated Knapp Spreadsheet
5/30/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to A. Wand re returning class member phone call
5/30/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
5/30/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Providing a class member with information on settlement
5/30/2017	LAR	\$250	0.1	\$25	Speaking to class member regarding settlement
5/31/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	Incoming call from class member with questions regarding voucher
5/31/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	email with J. Prutsman re comments and revisions to standardized messages to class member emails
5/31/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
6/1/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review filed objection and email from M. Keshavarzi re same
6/1/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Updating information regarding settlement for a class member
6/2/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review filed objection
6/5/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
6/5/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from M. Kesharvarzi re call to discuss class member objections
6/6/2017	JXK	\$775	0.6	\$465	calls with A. Wand and M. Keshavarzi re processing class inquiries and responding to objections
6/6/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to J. Prutsman re inquiry about objector
6/6/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
6/6/2017	LAR	\$250	0.2	\$50	Speaking with class member re regarding settlement
6/7/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
6/8/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails to J. Prutsman re class member inquiries and follow-up to same
6/16/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	emails with A. Wand re motion for attorneys' fees and costs
6/19/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to E. Gueorguieva re compiling attorneys fees and costs for motion
6/20/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.1	\$60	Listened to VM message(s)
6/20/2017	MXJ	\$600	0.2	\$120	Outgoing call to class member returning their call and VM Message
6/20/2017	JXK	\$775	0.5	\$388	review objections and review, respond to, and process class member inquiries
6/23/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	review and reply to email from A. Wand re filing of motion for attorneys' fees
6/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	call with T. Schneider re information for attorneys' fee motion
6/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.1	\$78	email to C. Cottrell re information for attorneys' fee motion
6/26/2017	JXK	\$775	0.3	\$233	review and comment on draft declarations for attorneys' fee motion
6/27/2017	JXK	\$775	0.2	\$155	process class member inquiries
6/28/2017	JXK	\$775	5.5	\$4,263	revise memorandum in support of motion for attorney's fees and additional research for same
6/29/2017	JXK	\$775	3.5	\$2,713	revise memorandum in support of attorneys' fees, emails with A. Wand re same, call with J. Konecky re same, draft supporting declaration, revise time and cost invoices

6/29/2017 STM	\$300	3.8	\$1,140	Draft tables for Mtn for Atty Fees; Format for filing
Grand Total		362.26	\$245,597	
Friday, June 30, 2017				Page 1 of 1